
Men of Good Deeds 
 

Likewise urge the young men to be sensible; in all things show yourself to be an 
example of good deeds, with purity in doctrine, digni�ed, sound in speech 
which is beyond reproach, so that the opponent will be put to shame, having 
nothing bad to say about us. Titus 2:6-8 

 
1. Good Deeds are Crucial in the Life of Every Christian 

 
Brethren, join in following my example, and observe those who walk 
according to the pattern you have in us. Philippians 3:17 

 
not because we do not have the right to this, but in order to o�er ourselves 
as a model for you, so that you wo uld follow our example. 2 Thessalonians 
3:9 

 
Let no one look down on your youthf ulness, but rather in speech, conduct, 
love, faith and purity, show yourself an example of those who believe. 1 
Timothy 4:12 

 
Be imitators of me, just as I al so am of Christ. 1 Corinthians 11:1 

 
Keep your behavior excellent among the Gentiles, so that in the thing in 
which they slander you as evildoers, they may because of your good deeds, 
as they observe them, glorify God in the day of visitation. 1 Peter 2:12 

 
2. Good deeds are the evidence of true _________________ 

 
Even so faith, if it has no works, is  dead, being by itself. But someone may 
well say, You have faith and I have works; show me your faith without the 
works, and I will show you my faith by my works. You believe that God is 
one. You do well; the demons also believe, and shudder. But are you willing 
to recognize, you foolish fellow, that faith without works is useless?  James 
2:17-20  

3. He has saved us for good deeds 
 

4. Good deeds are what we are judged by 
 

5. Good deeds are the essential 
 



6. Good deeds are an emphatic _________________ for spiritual leadership 
 
It happened that as we were going to the place of prayer, a slave-girl having 
a spirit of divination met us, who was bringing her masters much profit by 
fortune-telling.  Acts 16:16 
 
For a man named Demetrius, a silversmith, who made silver shrines of 
Artemis, was bringing no little business to the craftsmen;  Acts 19:24 
 
Instruct those who are rich in this present world not to be conceited or to fix 
their hope on the uncertainty of riches, but on God, who richly supplies us 
with all things to enjoy.  1 Timothy 6:17 
 
nor to pay attention to myths and endless genealogies, which give rise to 
mere speculation rather than furthering the administration of God which is 
by faith.  1 Timothy 1:4 
 
Until I come, give attention to the public reading of Scripture, to exhortation 
and teaching.  1 Timothy 4:13 
 
Brethren, join in following my example, and observe those who walk 
according to the pattern you have in us. Philippians 3:17 
 
So the other disciples were saying to him, We have seen the Lord! But he 
said to them, Unless I see in His hands the imprint of the nails, and put my 
finger into the place of the nails, and put my hand into His side, I will not 
believe.  John 20:25 
 
who gave Himself for us to redeem us from every lawless deed, and to purify 
for Himself a people for His own possession, zealous for good deeds.  Titus 
2:14 
 
Remind them to be subject to rulers, to authorities, to be obedient, to be 
ready for every good deed, Titus 3:1 
 
This is a trustworthy statement; and concerning these things I want you to 
speak confidently, so that those who have believed God will be careful to 
engage in good deeds. These things are good and profitable for men. Titus 
3:8 
 

7. The Results of Biblical Good Deeds are ______________ 
 
nor yet as lording it over those allotted to your charge, but proving to be 
examples to the flock.  1 Peter 5:3 
 
so that they may encourage the young women to love their husbands, to 



love their children, to be sensible, pure, workers at home, kind, being 
subject to their own husbands, so that the word of God will not be 
dishonored.  Titus 2:4-5 
 
having a reputation for good works; and if she has brought up children, if 
she has shown hospitality to strangers, if she has washed the saints feet, if 
she has assisted those in distress, and if she has devoted herself to every 
good work.  1 Timothy 5:10 
 
But Jesus said, Let her alone; why do you bother her? She has done a good 
deed to Me. For you always have the poor with you, and whenever you wish 
you can do good to them; but you do not always have Me. She has done 
what she could; she has anointed My body beforehand for the burial. Truly I 
say to you, wherever the gospel is preached in the whole world, what this 
woman has done will also be spoken of in memory of her.  Mark 14:6-9 
 
Keep your behavior excellent among the Gentiles, so that in the thing in 
which they slander you as evildoers, they may because of your good deeds, 
as they observe them, glorify God in the day of visitation.  1 Peter 2:12 
 
in all things show yourself to be an example of good deeds, with purity in 
doctrine, dignified,  Titus 2:7 
 
His master said to him, Well done, good and faithful slave. You were faithful 
with a few things, I will put you in charge of many things; enter into the joy 
of your master. Matthew 25:21 


